
 
 

June Reflections 

 

Good news...the average number of deficiencies decreased from 12.0 to 9.9...GREAT JOB, 
FOLKS! There were 5 G level tags cited, one in each of the old regions.  Another piece of good 

news is that there was only 1 G tag for pressure ulcers.  That is a significant improvement for 

sure!  It looks like many of you are putting improved processes in place to reduce pressure ulcer 
risk...not just the same old interventions that have been used in the past.  Once again...GREAT 

JOB!  Let’s keep up the good work.   
 

71% of the surveys reviewed resulted in F323, Accidents/Hazards and 4 of the 5 G tags occurred 

with F323, all of which involved falls with significant injuries.  In 2013, F323 ranked 2nd in Kansas 
and 3rd nationally in being cited as a deficient practice, so that hasn’t changed much.  So, let’s 

talk “best practice” to prevent falls.  Would it surprise you that the vast majority of falls that were 
thoroughly investigated for causal factors were related to the elder needing to toilet?  It is vital 

that each facility develops innovative interventions to improve continency for each elder as 

possible.  Each elder should be assessed in detail on admission/readmission, quarterly and with 
any significant changes.  Included in the assessment should be a 3 day voiding diary along with 

specific reasons for incontinency.  Is the incontinency urgency, stress, functional, mixed, or 
something else?  The assessment should address prostate problems, constipation, UTIs, 

medications, mental status, mobility limitations, frequency, type, circumstances and duration of 
the incontinency.  From there, a nurse evaluates the results of the assessment and consults the 

physician, prompting consideration of effects of anticholinergic medications, the potential benefits 

of a toileting program and any other interventions possible.   
 

Previously, a generic care plan was implemented such as “toileted upon arising, before and after 
meals and at bedtime” or “toilet every 2-3 hours”, but following an effective bowel/bladder 

assessment the toileting care plan can be individualized specifying the toileting schedule for that 

specific elder.  Staff should investigate each case in which an elder does not have an individual 
plan to confirm that there is a valid reason for lack of a plan.   

 
The next, and probably most challenging part of a good continence program is getting the 

program consistently implemented as planned.  If your facility uses pagers, or other silent alert 
devices, the plan can be programmed into that system to alert staff.  In ANY case, the plan 

should be specifically spelled out on the care plan and the direct care partners should be 

educated on the program and urged to follow the plan.  Staff MUST understand why the program 
is important before they will follow the program.  Then they must be held accountable to the 

program.   
 

Reassessment is also vital.  If, on the planned program, the elder is still incontinent multiple 

times during a 24 hour period, the plan needs to be changed and changed quickly...don’t wait 
until the next RAI cycle date.   

 
Just in case you think this is all “hocus pocus”, here are some statistics about the relationship 

between falls and effective toileting programs.  Research completed at a facility that developed a 

system to develop individualized toileting program shows that falls are highest in the elders’ 
rooms, usually occurring when the elder is on the way to or in the bathroom.  Implementation of 

an individualized toileting schedule has markedly improved fall rates.  The rate of falls fell from 
8.345 falls per 1,000 elder days in 2003 to 6.1 per 1000 days in 2006 to 2.0 per 1000 elder days 

in (0.2%) in 2012.  Now...that’s an effective QAPI program! 



 

Other benefits can be obtained from implementing individualized toileting programs too...the 
same research shows that incontinence (F315) decreased from 76% of elders coded as 

occasional or frequently incontinent in 2004 to 31% coded as occasional or frequently incontinent 
in 2012 after full implementation of the individualized toileting program.  Just consider how many 

elders that affected...and consider how much impact that had on a true quality of life for those 

elders that were successful!  It would probably be safe to say that no one has being incontinent 
on their “bucket list”.  Right? Other benefits realized from a comprehensive individualized 

toileting program includes a reduction in pressure ulcers from 12.4% in 2003 to 4.0% in 2012 
and in 2013 the rate fell to less than 1%.  (Just as a reminder, F314 Pressure Ulcers, has been a 

real problem for G tags in Kansas over the past several months.)    
 

The real key to success in preventing falls is thoroughly investigating and effectively assessing 

each elder and each fall for each elder to determine the root cause and causal factors for the falls 
and implementing effective interventions. 

 
As you all know by now, stakeholders will no longer receive copies of the 2567s as they are 

created.  It is my earnest belief that the information received from those documents were used 

to assist providers to give better care to the elders served.  I will continue to review reports that 
are accessible, and the only way for them to be accessible at this point in a timely manner is for 

you to send them to me for review as you get them.  As always, the results will be used to 
develop trends to assist you in putting systems in place to meet the needs of the elders AND 

meet the expectations of the regulatory system.  It takes numbers to develop trends, so please 
consider sending me or your association the results of your surveys.  I don’t want you to think 

the surveys will be “secret”.  The current plan is to notify the stakeholders of which facilities were 

surveyed each month and then at some point they will be posted on the KDADS website and the 
CMS Nursing Home Compare website.  The time delay will certainly delay timely reporting of 

findings to help you, which is why I believe it is important to continue to gather timely data.  I 
will continue to analyze the data I receive.  If you send me your 2567s, I will send you the 

findings and analysis.  You may send your results to: lindaf670@gmail.com or 

linda@licamedman.com.   
 

I hope you are all having a wonderful summer and everyone is afforded the time for some time 
off for refreshment, rejuvenation and relaxation.   
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